Land Use

Courthouse Annex < 2045 13th Street « Boulder, Colorado 80302 « Tel: 303.441.3930 - Fax: 303.441.4856
Mailing Address: P.O. Box 471 < Boulder, Colorado 80306 « www.bouldercounty.org

Building Safety & Inspection Services Team

BOULDER COUNTY FIRE CODE REVIEW COMMITTEE
DOCKET #FCRC-14-0002
PUBLIC HEARING
MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FIRE CODE
(2012 IFC)
Thursday, July 17, 2014 — 3:30 P.M.
Boulder County Land Use Department
Caribou Conference Room, 2" Floor, Courthouse Annex
2045 13™ St., Boulder, CO 80302

Staff: Gary Goodell, Chief Building Official, Secretary to the Fire Code Review Committee

The Mountain View Fire Protection District lies in the northeast and east central portions of the
unincorporated county north and south of the City of Longmont, extending south to the Town of
Erie and east into Weld County, including the Niwot area. Mountain View maintains stations in
Longmont, Niwot, Brownsville, Erie, Mead and Dacono. The district’s board of directors has
adopted the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code (“IFC”), including Appendices B, C, E,
F, G, Hand I, by resolution dated April 22, 2014 (attached). The proposed adoption is similar to
previous adoptions by the district.

Staff has a number of positive comments on the proposed fire code adoption:

1. 2012 Edition. Adopting the latest edition of the International Fire Code (“IFC”) is en-
couraged, and this correlates well with the county’s adoption of the 2012 International
Codes.

2. Consistency. As we move toward more fire districts updating their codes to the most cur-
rent version, everyone involved in design, construction, codes administration and the
ownership and operations of buildings and facilities benefits through improved consisten-
cy from one district to another.

3. Permits. As with recent adoptions by other districts, the district has reviewed the various
categories of operational and construction permits in Section 105 of the published IFC
and has either retained or deleted them based upon the based upon the district’s needs as
well as their ability or desire to administer the permitting that is involved.

One relatively minor item is that the district has proposed to adopt Appendices E and G, which,
on their title pages, contain the language, “This appendix is for information purposes and is not
intended for adoption.” If, as stated, the appendix is not intended for adoption, there is no reason
for the district to formally adopt these appendices and assume the greater responsibility of en-
forcing them as part of their adopted fire code. On the other hand, the district may have specific
reasons for including the adoption of these appendices.

Cindy Domenico County Commissioner Deb Gardner County Commissioner Elise Jones County Commissioner



STAFF RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends that the Fire Code Review Committee
recommend to the Board of County Commissioners that the proposed Mountain View FPD Fire
Code be ACCEPTED for administration by the district in those portions of unincorporated Boul-
der County that lie within the boundaries of the Mountain View Fire Protection District, subject
to the recommended CONDITION that Appendices E and G be deleted from the list of appen-
dices being adopted.

GRG:grg

Attachment.  Mountain View FPD Fire Code Adopting Resolution dated April 22, 2013



Analysis to the Mountain View Fire Protection District
2012 International Fire Code® Amendments

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 101.1 Title. These Regulations shall be
known as the Fire Code of the Mountain View Fire Protection District, hereinafter
referred to as “this code”.

Analysis to Amendment: To establish this code is the Fire Code for the Mountain View
Fire Protection District.

Section 102.5 Application of residential code, is amended by the addition of an
Exception, to Item 1 only, to read as follows:

EXCEPTION: Dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems, or portions thereof,
installed in accordance with Section P2904 of the 2012 International
Residential Code® do not require a permit. Nevertheless, dwelling unit fire
sprinkler systems, or portions thereof, installed in accordance with NFPA 13D
require a permit pursuant to Section 105.7.1 of this code.

Analysis to Amendment: The exception is added to make it clear that if a residential
sprinkler system is provided in accordance with NFPA 13D, they must obtain a permit
from the Fire District prior to proceeding with installation. This is in line with
requirements of the State of Colorado.

Section 102.7 is amended to read as follows: 102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The
codes and standards referenced in this code shall be the most recent edition of those that
are listed in Chapter 80 and such codes and standards shall be considered part of the
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between the provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the
provisions of this code shall apply.

Analysis to Amendment: So that the most recent standards may be used instead of
having to use those specific standards referenced in Chapter 80 that may be several code
cycles behind.

Section 103.4 Liability shall be amended by the addition of the following paragraph at the end
of the section: “Nothing herein shall be construed as a waiver of any immunity provided be

Section 24-10-101, et seq., C.R.S. or by other statutes, or by the common law.”

Analysis to Amendment: To avoid conflict with the Colorado Revised Statutes.

308541



Section 105.4.1 is amended to read as follows: 105.4.1 Suvbmittals. Construction
documents shall be submitted in one or more sets and in such form and detail as required
by the fire code official. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered
design professional when said documents are submitted in support of an application for a
construction permit. When requested, qualification statements shall be submitted to the
fire code official for the registered design professional to demonstrate compliance with
the professional qualifications defined in Section 202.

Analysis to Amendment: To provide a means for the Fire District to get additional proof
that the individual designing the plans is truly qualified in the field of work for which plans
are submitted.

Section 105.6 Operational Permits is amended by deletion of Sections 105.6.11, 105.6.15,
105.6.17, 105.6.23, 105.6.38 as published.

Analysis to Amendment: Having to obtain a permit for welding/cutting operations,
operation of fire hydrants, conducting floor finishing and for refrigeration equipment is
deleted. Refrigeration equipment is regulated by the mechanical code and fire hydrants are
owned by separate water providers. Trying to regulate or know when an individual may
finish their floors or conduct hotwork operations is near impossible.

Section 105.6.30 shall be amended by the addition of the following sentence: “No such
permit shall be required where burning is regulated pursuant to regulations promuigated
under Section 25-7-123, C.R.S., and regulated by the Boulder/Weld County Health
Departments or municipal authorities.”

Analysis to Amendment: The requirement for a permit to burn is not required where
burning is regulated pursuant to regulations promulgated under Section 25-7-123, C.R.S.,
and regulated by the Boulder/Weld County Health Departments or municipal authorities.

Section 105.7.6 is amended to read as follows: 105.7.6 Fire alarm and detection systems
and related equipment. A construction permit is required for installation of or
modification to fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment, including
emergency alarm systems and smoke confrol systems. Maintenance performed in
accordance with this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit.

Analysis to Amendment: To add the requirement that emergency alarms and smoke
control systems required by the fire code are also reviewed by the Fire District.

A new Section 105.7.17, Explosion control, is added to read as follows: 105.7.17

Explosion control. A construction permit is required to install or modify explosion
control provided as required in Section 911.

A0R54.1



Analysis to Amendment: To add the requirement that explosion control systems required
by the fire code are also reviewed by the Fire District.

Section 108.1 is repealed in its entirety and re-enacted to read as follows:

108.1 Appeals Procedure - General. Any person, firm or corporation aggrieved by any
application, interpretation or order made by fire district personnel, pursuant to any
provision of the code or the standards adopted, may file, within five (5) days, a written
notice of appeal with the fire district requesting a hearing before the fire chief. All
appeals must be made in writing to the fire chief at the District’s Administrative Office,
3561 North Stagecoach Road, Longmont, Colorado, 80504. The fire chief shall establish
reasonable rules for such appeal and shall make a record of all proceedings. The decision
of the fire chief shall be considered a final administrative decision.

108.1.1 Appeals Procedure — Administrative Decisions. To determine the suitability of
alternate materials and types of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations
of the provisions of this code, there shall be, and is hereby created, a board of appeals
consisting of five members who are qualified by experience and training to pass
judgment upon pertinent matters. The fire chief shall be an ex officio member of said
board of appeals but shall have no vote on any mater before the board. The board of
appeals shall be appointed by the Board of Directors and shall hold office at its pleasure.
The board of appeals shall adopt reasonable rules of procedure for conducting its business,
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy
to the fire chief. All appeals of the fire chief’s decision shall be made in writing, within
three (3) days of the date of the fire chief’s decision, to the Board of Directors by delivery
to the District Fire Chief or his representative at the District’s Administrative Office,
3561 North Stagecoach Road, Longmont, Colorado, 80504.

Analysis to Amendment: The appeals procedure has been amended to allow the
aggrieved person, firm or corporation and the Fire District to reach an agreement with the
Chief before taking the appeals process to the final appeals board as outlined in the
Resolution.

Section 109.4 is amended to read as follows: 109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who
shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate
used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine
of not more than ONE THOUSAND ($1,000.00) DOLLARS or by imprisonment not
exceeding ONE (1) YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day during which
such violation continues, shall be deemed a separate offense.

Analysis to Amendment: To set fines and penalties violations.

30854.1



Section 111.4 is amended to read as follows: 111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who
shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except such work
as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable
to a fine and/or imprisonment up to the maximum specified in Section 32-1-1001 and 1002,
CR.S. Each day in which such violation occurs shall constitute a separate violation
pursuant to Section 32-1002(3)(d) C.R.S.

Analysis to Amendment: To set fines for failure to comply as allowed in the Colorado
Revised Statutes.

A new Section 113, Fees, is added to read as follows:

113.1 Fees. Fees for services pursuant to the provisions of this code shall be established
from time to time by resolution of the Board of Directors pursuant to Section 32-1-
1002(1)(j) C.R.S. Said fees and charges may include a charge for reimbursement to the fire
district of any consultation fees, expenses or costs incurred by the fire district in the
performance of inspection related services pursuant to provisions of this code.

113.2 Payment of fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by law have
been paid; nor shall an amendment to a permit be released until additional fees, if any,
has been paid.

113.3 Operational permit fee. An inspection fee may be charged for any operational
permit required by Section 105.6. The inspection fee shall be based upon the time
required to conduct inspections authorized by Section 105.2.2 and associated activities, to
determine compliance with this code and other applicable laws and ordinances as
required by Section 105.2.4, and to issue the permit as specified in Section 105.3.7.

113.4 Construction permit fee. A fee may be charged for any construction permit
required by Section 105.7 of this code. The construction permit fee is intended to cover
the cost of inspections required or requested in connection with the work for which the
permit is granted, and the associated costs of processing the application. An application
shall include an estimate of the total value of the work, including materials and labor, for
which the permit is being sought. If, in the opinion of the fire code official, the valuation
is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied, unless written estimates
are provided in a form acceptable to the fire code official, and that support the valuation
set forth in the application. Final construction permit valuation shall be set by the fire
code official.

113.5 Other inspection fee. Fees for reinspections, for inspections outside normal

business hours, or for inspections for which no fee is otherwise established may be
charged.

30854.1



113.6 Plan review fee. The plan review fee is intended to cover the significant costs and
expenses incurred by the fire district in reviewing materials necessary to perform
appropriate inspections of construction, uses, processes, and operations. The fee shall be
assessed based on the reasonmable, customary, and necessary time associated with
reviewing or evaluating site plans; construction documents and calculations; changes,
additions, or revisions to approved plans; consiruction documents resubmitted after the
fire code official's issuing a statement explaining the reasons that a previous submittal
does not conform to the requirements of this code. When submittal documents are
incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an additional plan review
fee shall be charged. The plan review fee required by this Section 112.6 is separate from
the construction permit fee required by Section 113.4.

113.7 Unauthorized Work Inspection Fee. Any person or entity who commences any
work before obtaining a construction permit required by Section 105.7 shall be subject to
an inspection fee in an amount equal to the amount of the construction permit fee. The
fee shall be separate from and in addition to a construction permit fee. Payment of the
inspection fee shall not relieve any person from compliance with all other provisions of
this code or from any penalty prescribed by law. The inspection fee shall be assessed
regardless whether or not a construction permit is then or subsequently issued.
EXCEPTION: When approved in writing by the fire code official, work may commence
prior to obtaining a construction permiit.

113.8 Related Fees. The payment of the fee for construction, uses, processes, or
operations authorized by an operational permit or construction permit shall not relieve the
applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by
law or required by Section 113.

Analysis to Amendment: To allow for the collection of fees within the District pursuant to
Section 32-1-1002(1)(j) C.R.S., for services or programs.

Section 905.2 is amended to read as follows: 905.2 Installation standards. Standpipe
systems shall be installed in accordance with this section and NFPA 14. Fire hose is not
required for any class of standpipe system.

Analysis to Amendment: Hose often provided by an occupant is not normally
maintained, racked properly, is usually single jacket hose and the Fire District will use not
this hose. The Fire District would prefer building occupants to exit the building rather than
try to fight fire with hose because the occupants are typically not trained.

Section 3103.5 is amended to read as follows: 3103.5 Use period. Temporary tents, air-

supported, air-inflated or tensioned membrane structures shall not be erected for a period
of more than 30 days within a 12-month pericd on a single premises.

30834.1



Analysis to Amendment: To limit the use of tents or similar structures to 30 days rather
than 180 days. These are meant to be temporary structures for special activities or events
and not to be used as semi-permanent structures for warehousing or other operations, which
can occur when the use period is 180 days.

Section 5601.1.3 is amended to read as follows: 5601.1.3 Fireworks. Exception #2 is
deleted in its entirety. '

Analysis to Amendment: To prohibit the manufacture, assembly and testing of
fireworks as allowed by the exception. We do not want this activity located anywhere
within the Fire District.

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 is amended to read as follows: 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where
above-ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground
tanks outside of buildings is prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning
regulation adopted by Boulder/Weld Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or
Mead.

Analysis to Amendment: To allow for local zoning ordinances in the counties or
incorporated municipalities to set limits on these type of materials.

Section 5706.2.4.4 is amended to read as follows: 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-
ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks is
prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted by Boulder/Weld
Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead.

Analysis to Amendment: To allow for local zoning ordinances in the counties or
incorporated municipalities to set limits on these type of materials.

Section 5806.2. The second paragraph in subsection 5806.2, Location, is amended to
read as follows: Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers outside
of buildings is prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted
by Boulder/Weld Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead.

Analysis to Amendment: To allow for local zoning ordinances in the counties or
incorporated municipalities to set limits on these type of materials.

Section 6004.2.2.7 Treatment systems, is amended by the deletion of the exceptions.

Analysis to Amendment: The Uniform Codes required-treatment systems to be
provided wherever toxic or highly toxic gases were used. When the I-Codes were
developed these provisions were diluted by the addition of exceptions. By the deletion of
the exceptions, we are ensured that wherever toxic or highly toxic gases are used or
stored, safety systems are in place to scrub the gas to a safe level in the event of a leak.

30854.1



Section 6104.2, Maximum capacity within established limits (retaining the Exception as
printed), is amended to read as follows: 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established
limits. The limits, in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby
established as follows: as addressed by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted by
Boulder/Weld Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead. This section
shall not be interpreted so as to be in conflict with the provisions of Section 8-20-101 et
seq. and Section 34-64-101 et seq., C.R.S.

Analysis to Amendment: To allow for local zoning ordinances in the counties or
incorporated municipalities to set limits on these type of materials.

30854,1



RESOLUTION NO. 2014-01
FIRE CODE
MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2012 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE®, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE
COUNCIL, REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND
PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE
STORAGE, HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS
AND DEVICES, AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY
IN THE OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES; AND PROVIDING FOR
THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES.

WHEREAS, by Resolution, dated April 21, 2014, the Board of Directors of the Mountain View
Fire Protection District adopted the 2012 Edition of the International Fire Code® in part; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors deems it necessary and believes that it is in the best interest
of public safety to adopt and enforce fire codes for the purpose of establishing rules of conduct
and standards for the protection of life, health, property, security and welfare of the inhabitants
of the District; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors has considered the effect of fire code enforcement within
the boundaries of the District and has determined that enforcement of the proposed codes would
not cause undue hardship or suppression of economic growth within the District; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors has studied the necessity for realistic and reasonable level
of fire protection to be provided by a rural fire protection district, which includes areas of high
density residential, commercial, and industrial development;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE
MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT THAT:

SECTION I. Adoption of the 2012 International Fire Code®.
A. CODE ADOPTED

The 2012 International Fire Code®, including the following appendices: The 2012
International Fire Code® is adopted in the form, including those Sections as amended
herein, and the following appendices: Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements for
Buildings; Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution; Appendix E, Hazard
Categories; Appendix F, Hazard Ranking; Appendix G, Cryogenic Fluids - Weight and
Volume Equivalents; Appendix H, Hazardous Materials Management Plan and
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement Instructions,



The date on which this Resolution shall take effect within the incorporated municipalities
within this District shall be the date of approval by the governing board of said
municipality and the date on which it shall take effect within the unincorporated portions
of Boulder/Weld Counties shall be on the date of approval by the Boards of County
Commissioners in and for the Counties of Boulder/Weld, State of Colorado. This Code
shall be in effect within the territorial limits of the Mountain View Fire Protection
District.

B. CODE DESCRIBED

The 2012 International Fire Code® is published by the International Code Council, 4051
West Flossmore Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478.

C. COPIES ON FILE

At least one copy of the 2012 International Fire Code®, as amended and adopted herein,
shall be on file in the Administration Offices of the Mountain View Fire Protection
District, 3561 North Stagecoach Road, Longmont, Colorado 80504, and may be
inspected during regular business hours.

D. PURPOSE

The purpose of the code is not to create or otherwise establish or designate any particular
class or group of persons who will or should be especially protected or benefited by the
terms of the code.

The purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirements consistent with
nationally recognized good practice for providing a reasonable level of life safety and
property protection from the hazards of fire, explosion, or dangerous conditions in new
and existing buildings, structures, and premises and to provide safety to fire fighters and
emergency responders during emergency operations.

Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted.
SECTION II: Definitions

Wherever the term “Board of Directors” is used, it shall be held to mean the Board of Directors
of the Mountain View Fire Protection District.

Wherever the word “District” or phrase “Fire District” is used, it shall mean the Mountain View
Fire Protection District.

Wherever the term “International Building Code®” is used, it shall be held to mean the Building
Code as adopted, amended and incorporated into the Boulder/Weld County Building Code, or
the codes of incorporated municipalities.



Wherever the term “International Electrical Code®” is used, it shall be held to mean the
Electrical Code as adopted, amended and incorporated into the Boulder/Weld County Electrical
Code, or the codes of incorporated municipalities.

SECTION III: Amendments Made in and to the 2012 International Fire Code®,

The 2012 International Fire Code® is amended and changed in the following respects:

A.

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 101.1 Title. These Regulations shall be
known as the Fire Code of the Mountain View Fire Protection District, hereinafter
referred to as “this code”.

Section 102.5, Application of residential code, is amended by the addition of an
Exception, to Item 1 only, to read as follows:

EXCEPTION: Dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems, or portions thereof, installed in
accordance with Section P2904 of the 2012 International Residential Code® do not
require a permit. Nevertheless, dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems, or portions
thereof, installed in accordance with NFPA 13D require a permit pursuant to Section
105.7.1 of this code.

Section 102.7 is amended to read as follows: 102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The
codes and standards referenced in this code shall be the most recent edition of those that
are listed in Chapter 80 and such codes and standards shall be considered part of the
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between the provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the
provisions of this code shall apply.

Section 103.4 Liability shall be amended by the addition of the following sentence at the
end of the section: “Nothing herein shall be construed as a waiver of any immunity
provided by Section 24-10-101, et seq., C.R.S. or by other statutes, or by the common
law.”

Section 105.4.1 is amended to read as follows: 105.4.1 Submittals. Construction
documents shall be submitted in one or more sets and in such form and detail as required
by the fire code official. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered
design professional when said documents are submitted in support of an application for a
construction permit. When requested, qualification statements shall be submitted to the
fire code official for the registered design professional to demonstrate compliance with
the professional qualifications defined in Section 202.

Section 105.6 Operational Permits is amended by deletion of Sections 105.6.11, 105.6.15,

105.6.17, 105.6.23, 105.6.38 as published.



Section 105.6.30 shall be amended by the addition of the following sentence: “No such
permit shall be required where burning is regulated pursuant to regulations promulgated
under Section 25-7-123, C.R.S., and regulated by the Boulder/Weld County Health
Departments or municipal authorities.”

Section 105.7.6 is amended to read as follows: 105.7.6 Fire alarm and detection systems
and related equipment. A construction permit is required for installation of or
modification to fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment, including
emergency alarm systems and smoke control systems. Maintenance performed in
accordance with this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit.

A new Section 105.7.17, Explosion control, is added to read as follows:

105.7.17 Explosion control. A construction permit is required to install or modify
explosion control provided as required in Section 911.

Subsection 108.1 is repealed in its entirety and re-enacted to read as follows:

108.1 Appeals Procedure - General. Any person, firm or corporation aggrieved by any
application, interpretation or order made by fire district personnel, pursuant to any
provision of the code or the standards adopted, may file, within five (5) days, a written
notice of appeal with the fire district requesting a hearing before the fire chief. All
appeals must be made in writing to the fire chief at the District’s Administrative Office,
3561 North Stagecoach Road, Longmont, Colorado, 80504. The fire chief shall establish
reasonable rules for such appeal and shall make a record of all proceedings. The decision
of the fire chief shall be considered a final administrative decision.

108.1.1 Appeals Procedure — Administrative Decisions. To determine the suitability of
alternate materials and types of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations
of the provisions of this code, upon request of an interested party, including the fire chief
or designee, there shall be, and is hereby created, a board of appeals consisting of five
members who are qualified by experience and training to pass judgment upon pertinent
matters. The board of appeals shall be appointed by the Board of Directors and shall hold
office at its pleasure. The board of appeals shall adopt reasonable rules of procedure for
conducting its business, and shall render all interpretations, decisions and findings in
writing to the appellant or requesting party with a duplicate copy to the fire chief. All
appeals of the fire chief’s decision shall be made in writing, within five (5) days of the
date of the fire chief’s decision, to the Board of Directors by delivery to the District Fire
Chief or his representative at the District’s Administrative Office, 3561 North Stagecoach
Road, Longmont, Colorado, 80504,

Section 109.4 is amended to read as follows: 109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who
shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate
used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine



of not more than ONE THOUSAND ($1,000.00) DOLLARS or by imprisonment not
exceeding ONE (1) YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day during which
such violation continues, shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 111.4 is amended to read as follows: 111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who
shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except such work
as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable
to a fine and/or imprisonment up to the maximum specified in Section 32-1-1001 and 1002,
CR.S. Each day in which such violation occurs shall constitute a separate violation
pursuant to Section 32-1002(3)(d) C.R.S.

Section 113, Fees, is deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

113.1 Fees. Fees for services pursuant to the provisions of this code shall be established
from time to time by resolution of the Board of Directors pursuant to Section 32-1-
1002(1)(j) C.R.S. Said fees and charges may include a charge for reimbursement to the fire
district of any consultation fees, expenses or costs incurred by the fire district in the
performance of inspection related services pursuant to provisions of this code.

113.2 Payment of fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by law have
been paid; nor shall an amendment to a permit be released until additional fees, if any,
has been paid. '

113.3 Operational permit fee. An inspection fee may be charged for any operational
permit required by Section 105.6. The inspection fee shall be based upon the time
required to conduct inspections authorized by Section 105.2.2 and associated activities, to
determine compliance with this code and other applicable laws and ordinances as
required by Section 105.2.4, and to issue the permit as specified in Section 105.3.7.

113.4 Construction permit fee. A fee may be charged for any construction permit
required by Section 105.7 of this code. The construction permit fee is intended to cover
the cost of inspections required or requested in connection with the work for which the
permit is granted, and the associated costs of processing the application. An application
shall include an estimate of the total value of the work, including materials and labor, for
which the permit is being sought. If, in the opinion of the fire code official, the valuation
1s underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied, unless written estimates
are provided in a form acceptable to the fire code official, and that support the valuation
set forth in the application. Final construction permit valuation shall be set by the fire
code official.

113.5 Other inspection fee. Fees for reinspections, for inspections outside normal
business hours, or for inspections for which no fee is otherwise established may be
charged.

113.6 Plan review fee. The plan review fee is intended to cover the significant costs and
expenses incurred by the fire district in reviewing materials necessary to perform



appropriate inspections of construction, uses, processes, and operations. The fee shall be
assessed based on the reasomable, customary, and necessary time associated with
reviewing or evaluating site plans; construction documents and calculations; changes,
additions, or revisions to approved plans; construction documents resubmitted after the
fire code official's issuing a statement explaining the reasons that a previous submittal
does not conform to the requirements of this code. When submittal documents are
incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an additional plan review
tee shall be charged. The plan review fee required by this section is separate from the
construction permit fee required by Section 113 .4.

113.7 Unauthorized Work Inspection Fee. Any person or entity that commences any
work before obtaining a construction permit required by Section 105.7 shall be subject to
an inspection fee in an amount equal to the amount of the construction permit fee. The
fee shall be separate from and in addition to a construction permit fee. Payment of the
inspection fee shall not relieve any person from compliance with all other provisions of
this code or from any penalty prescribed by law. The inspection fee shall be assessed
regardless whether or not a construction permit is then or subsequently issued.

EXCEPTION: When approved in writing by the fire code official, work may
commence prior to obtaining a construction permit.

113.8 Related Fees. The payment of the fee for construction, uses, processes, or
operations authorized by an operational permit or construction permit shall not relieve the
applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by
law or required by Section 113.

Section 905.2, Installation standard is amended to read as follows:

905.2 Installation standard. Standpipe systems shall be installed in accordance with this
section and NFPA 14. Fire hose is not required for any class of standpipe system.

Section 3103.5 1s amended to read as follows: 3103.5 Use period. Temporary tents, air-
supported, air-inflated or tensioned membrane structures shall not be erected for a period
of more than 30 days within a 12-month period on a single premises.

Section 5601.1.3 is amended to read as follows: 5601.1.3 Fireworks. Exception #2 is
deleted in its entirety.

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 is amended to read as follows: 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-
ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks
outside of buildings is prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning regulation
adopted by Boulder/Weld Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead.

Section 5706.2.4.4 is amended to read as follows: 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-
ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks is



prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted by Boulder/Weld
Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead.

The second paragraph in subsection 5806.2, Location, is amended to read as follows:
Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers outside of buildings is
prohibited as established by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted by Boulder/Weld
Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead.

Section 6004.2.2.7 Treatment systems, is amended by the deletion of the exceptions.

Section 6104.2, Maximum capacity within established limits (retaining the Exception as
printed), is amended to read as follows: 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established
limits. The limits, in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby
established as follows: as addressed by any ordinance or zoning regulation adopted by
Boulder/Weld Counties, or the municipalities of Dacono, Erie, or Mead. This section
shall not be interpreted so as to be in conflict with the provisions of Section 8-20-101 et
seq. and Section 34-64-101 et seq., C.R.S.

SECTION IV: Enforcement and Appeals

A,

The Chief shall enforce this code in accordance with the procedures set forth in this code
and Section 32-1-1002(3), C.R.S.

A Notice of Violation or Hazard may be issued by the Chief or his designee concerning
violations or hazards which are not corrected on site during an inspection. An Order to
Comply may be issued by the Chief or his designee:

1. For failure to correct a violation or hazard with the time specified in a previously issued
Notice of Violation or Hazard; or

2. For violating the code or state statute and said violation renders the building, structure or
premises especially liable to fire or is hazardous to the safety of the occupants thereof, or
which is so situated as to endanger other property as set forth in Section 32-1-1002(3),
C.R.S, whether or not a Notice has been previously issued.

An appeal of a Notice of Violation or Hazard may be made in accordance with the
provisions of this code and resolution.

An appeal of an Order to Comply may be made in accordance with the provisions of this
code and resolution only if no previous appeal has been made of a previously issued Notice
of Violation or Hazard concerning the same violation or hazard.

In the event no appeal is made pursuant to this code and resolution, or to the court
pursuant to Section 32-1-1002(3), C.R.S, and compliance with an Order and/or correction
of a hazard has not occurred, the Chief or his designee may issue a Summons and Complaint
to the Municipal Court of the City or Town of the incorporated municipality in which the



violation occurs or refer the matter to the district attorney of the county in which the
violation occurs.

An appeal shall suspend the time limits for compliance or correction of a fire hazard or
hazards, until the appeal is resolved for appeals of a Notice of Violation or Hazard which is
issued pursuant to Section IV, paragraph B.1 herein. An appeal shall not suspend the time
limit for compliance or correction of life safety deficiencies or violations. An appeal of an
Order issued pursuant to Section, IV, paragraph B.2 herein shall not suspend the time limits
for compliance or correction, and compliance or correction shall be made or rendered
forthwith, unless the Order is suspended pursuant to the procedures set forth in this code and
resolution.

SECTION V: Violations-Penalties

A.

Violations of this Code are unlawful. Any owner, lessee, agent, or occupant of any building
or premises maintaining any condition likely to cause fire or to constitute an additional fire
hazard or any condition which impedes or prevents the egress of persons from such building
or premises in violation of the provisions of Section 32-1002(3) C.R.S., shall be deemed to
be maintaining a fire hazard. Any person who violates any provision of said subsection 3 is
guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction thereof, shall be punished by a fine and/or
imprisonment up to the maximum specified in Section 32-1-1001 and 1002, C.R.S. Each
day in which such violation occurs shall constitute a separate violation pursuant to Section
32-1002(3)(d) C.R.S.

Imposition of such penalties shall not limit any other equitable or legal right or remedy the
District may have to enforce this Code or to prevent the removal or correction of prohibited
conditions or other injunctive relief as appropriate under the circumstances.

SECTION VI: Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances or Resolutions.

All former ordinances or resolutions enacted by the District or parts thereof conflicting or
inconsistent with the provisions of this Resolution of the Code or Standards hereby adopted
are hereby repealed.

SECTION VII: Severance Clause,

The Mountain View Fire Protection District Board of Directors hereby declares that should
any article, section, paragraph, sentence, clause, phase or word of this Resolution or the
2012 International Fire Code®, as adopted and amended, is held to be unconstitutional or
invalid for any reason, such decision shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of the
remaining portions of this Resolution, Code or Standards.

SECTION VIII: Safety Clause.



The Board of Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District hereby finds, determines, and
declares that adoption of the 2012 International Fire Code®, as amended herein, is necessary for
the preservation of the public health, safety and welfare of the property and citizens within its
boundaries.

SECTION IX: Validity.

The Board of Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District hereby declares that should
any section, paragraph, sentence, clause, phase or word of this Resolution or the 2012 International
Fire Code® hereby adopted be declared for any reason to be invalid, it is the intent of the Board of
Directors of the Mountain View Fire Protection District that it would have passed all other portions
of this Resolution independent of the elimination here from any such portion as may be declared
invalid.

SECTION X: Effective Date.
This resolution shall take effect and be enforced within incorporated municipalities and

unincorporated portions of Boulder/Weld Counties from and after its approval as set forth in Section
32-1-1002(1)(d), C.R.S.

& -
INTRODUCED, READ AND ADOPTED ON THIS.zZ.2" DAY OF 42¢ e 2014,

MOUNTAIN VIEW FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

President

ATTEST:

i
oy P

Sec




